STATE OF NEW YORK TOWN BOARD MEETING
COUNTY OF DUTCHESS September 11, 2013
TOWN OF LA GRANGE

Present: Supervisor Joseph Luna
Councilman Edward Jessup
Councilman Gary Polhemus
Councilman Andrew P. Dyal

Councilman Alan Bell
Recording Secretary: Christine O’Reilly-Rao, Town Clerk
Others Present: Ron Blass, Esq. Van De Water & Van De Water

Wanda Livigni, Administrator of Public Works

The regular meeting of the Town Board was held on Wednesday, September 11, 2013, at 120
Stringham Road, Town of LaGrange. Supervisor Luna called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.
The Town Clerk led the flag salute.

Supervisor Luna asked for a motion to accept the minutes for August 28, 2013.
Councilman Jessup so moved, seconded by Councilman Bell. The motion carried unanimously.

Supervisor Luna asked for a motion to accept the monthly reports for August 2013.
Councilman Jessup so moved, seconded by Councilman Bell. The motion carried unanimously.

¢ Building, Zoning, Public Works & Planning ~ Total $22,485.00
e Highway Department Total $900.00

e Justice Egitto (incl. State Share) Total $15,837.50
e Justice O’Hare (incl. State Share) Total $23,957.00
e Recreation Total $7,847.25
e Town Clerk Total $1,340.01

Agenda

Mr. Luna asked for a motion to re-appoint Robert Taft as Town Assessor. The term of office is
six (6) years. Councilman Polhemus so moved, seconded by Councilman Dyal. The motion
carried unanimously.
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The Building Inspector requested Town Board approval to attend the NYS Building Officials
Conference in Lake George scheduled for September 11, 2013 through September 13, 2012. The
cost will not exceed $500.00. Councilman Polhemus moved to approve the request, seconded by
Councilman Dyal. The motion carried.

Resolution: Tax Certiorari for 48 Villa Lane; Grid #6361-03-393169-0000. (SEE
ADDENDUM)
Roll Call Vote: Ayes 5; Nays 0

Resolution: Toll Brothers Drainage Easement. (SEE ADDENDUM)
Roll Call Vote: Ayes 5; Nays 0

Supervisor Luna asked for Town Board approval to accept the name “Providence Way” for
Providence Estates. There are no conflicts within the municipality, fire district or postal zone.
Providence Way is a common driveway in Providence Estates.

Councilman Dyal moved to approve the name, seconded by Councilman Bell. The motion

carried.

Mr. Luna asked for a motion to accept the bid from Environmental Consultants for the upgrade
project for the Grandview Water District Booster Pump Station. The bid was the lowest of three
bids and the amount was $47,760.00.The other bids came in at $95,000.00 and $83,100.00
respectively. (SEE ADDENDUM)

Ms. Livigni stated that the proposed project had been approved after a Public Hearing in 2012,
with a borrowing amount of $221,000. In an effort to find the most cost effective way of
resolving the ongoing problems in the district, Ms. Livigni and Environmental Consultants
collected data to modify the proposed project. There will be some minor Change Orders within a
short time of the commencement of the work, but overall the amounts of the Change Orders
should not be too great. She added that Environmental Consultants knows the system very well
and that they are the best choice to work on remediating the problems.

Councilman Jessup moved to award the bid to Environmental Consultants, seconded by
Councilman Polhemus. The motion carried.

The Highway Superintendent requested Town Board’s permission to award Materials and Street
Sweeping Contracts for 2013-2014 to the lowest bidders. (SEE ADDENDUM — Lowest bids are
in bold type.)

Councilman Dyal moved to award the bids to the lowest bidder, seconded by Councilman Bell.
The motion carried.

Town Justice Stephen O’Hare requested approval for the Court Clerks, Sandra Dillon, Carolyn
Harklerode and Nancy Baughman, to attend the NYS Association of Magistrates Court Clerks
2013 Annual Conference on October 6, 2013 through October 9, 2013.

Supervisor Luna made a motion to deny the requést.
Councilman Bell asked why Mr. Luna wished to deny the request. Mr. Luna replied that it was
too costly to send all of the Clerks. Ms. Harklerode’s expenses will be paid by the Town of
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Stanford; however the $40 registration fee for the conference will be picked up by the Town of
Lagrange.
Councilman Jessup seconded the motion. The motion carried.

Committee Reports
Water and Sewer
Councilman Dyal stated that Ms. Livigni and the Comptroller were currently working on the

Special Districts 2014 budget. The Town is waiting for DOH input about the design of the Saxon
Drive Pump Station.

Recreation

No report

Open Space
No report
Highway

No report
Town Attorney
No comment
Public Works

Ms. Livigni asked for approval to attend a Stormwater Conference on MS4 regulations which
will be held in Beacon. There will be no cost to the Town.

Supervisor Luna moved to approve her request, seconded by Councilman Jessup. The motion
carried.

Town Board Comment

Councilman Polhemus asked Mr. Blass if it would be necessary to go out to bid regarding the
sale of some Town properties which are located on Frederick Drive and Scenic Hills.
Mr. Blass stated that there is no statutory regulation to do so.

Councilman Polhemus asked if the Town should get an independent appraisal on the properties.
Mr. Blass stated that getting an independent appraisal would be an appropriate step prior to the
sale.
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Public Comment

Councilman Jessup moved to open the Public Comment, seconded by Councilman Dyal. The
motion was carried by all.

Sina Macak addressed the Board. She congratulated Councilmen Bell and Jessup and Supervisor
Luna on the Primary. She added that it was an obvious win which reflected the voters’
confidence that things were being well run in the Town. She said that there had been outstanding
voter turnout in La Grange. She complimented the Town Board on the renovations to Town Hall,
both inside and out.

Councilman Bell moved to close the Public Comment, seconded by Councilman Polhemus. The
motion was carried by all.

Mr. Luna asked for a motion to adjourn the meeting to Executive Session at 7:22 pm.
Councilman Bell so moved, seconded by Councilman Jessup. The motion carried unanimously.

Supervisor Luna move to return to regular session, seconded by Councilman Jessup at 7:35 pm.
Councilman Jessup moved to adjourn the meeting, seconded by Councilman Dyal.

The meeting adjourned at 7:37 p.m.

Respectfully Submitted,

- \ .
O [wx
Christine O’Reilly-Rao
Town Clerk

ADDENDUM
e Resolution: Tax Certiorari 48 Villa Lane
e Resolution: Toll Brothers Easement
e Letter: Grandview Water District Pump Station Bid Recommendation

¢ Highway Bids
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RESOLUTION

iT IS HEREBY RESOLVED that Van DeWater & Van DeWater, LLP, Kyle W. Barnett,
Esq., of counsel, is authorized to enter into a Stipulation settling the tax certiorari
proceedings brought by Vail Road, LLC against the Town of LaGrangé for the 2012 tax
year and to sign such other and further papers as are necessary to effectuate the
settlement, said refunds to be without interest if paid within sixty (60) days of service of
a copy of the Judgment with notice of entry.

Dated: LaGrangeville, New York
September \{, 2013

MOVED BY:

SECONDED BY: Coo./m_Q/wm &%@,L
5

AYES:

NAYES: O

Chmsl OWLY/M

Tawn Gk




Tax Yr. 2012
Assessed Value
Reduced Value
Amount of Reduction

Per $1k of value
Town Tax Rate

Total Estimated Refund

Vail Road, LLC v. Town of LaGrange

$1,026,300.00
$450,000.00
$576,300.00

576.30
$2.66

$1,532.96



TOWN BOARD RESOLUTION

A
Crzuagilmm :255“? introduced the following resolution,
which was seconded by Coum;.]mﬁn &H :

Upon the offer of Dedication from Toll Land V Limited
Partnership of a drainage easement to the Town of LaGrange
covering portion of Lot 56 of Phase I of the Frank Farm
Subdivision identified and described in the annexed Schedule

\\AII
.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that, the Town Board accepts
the offer of Dedication of the aforesaid drainage easement in

such form as may be approved by the Town Attorney.

The foregoing resolution was duly put to a vote which
resulted as follows:

£
(5

Supervisor Luna A

.

D
~

Councilman Jessup

Councilman Polhemus

Z
lx)

Councilman Dyal PNE
Councilman Bell PN e
]

DATED: LaGrangeville, New York
September 11, 2013

@ NN NS

“Thristine 0O’ Rellly
Town Clerk

U:\DOCS\00070\00452\RESOLUTION\20U6369.DOC




SCHEDULE "A"

Land Planning
Engineering
Land Surveying

September 3, 2013

DESCRIPTION OF PROPERTY
DRAINAGE EASEMENT LOT 56
THE HILLS AT LAGRANGE (FRANK FARM SUBDIVISION)

All that certain lot or parcel of land being a portion of Lot 56, situated in the Town of
LaGrange, County of Dutchess, and State of New York, as shown on a map entitled
“OVERALL SUBDIVISION PLAT FOR FRANK FARM — PHASE ONE’", sheets 1-3,
revised dated 7/10/07, prepared by Morris Associates P.S., LLC & Gray Engineering,
P.C. and filed in the Dutchess County Clerk’s Office on 7/18/07 as Filed Map No.
10964H, Sheets 1-3; and being more particularly described as follows:

Beginning at a concrete monument, said monument being South 70 degrees 57
minutes 49 seconds East 175.00 feet from the corner common to Lot 56 and Lot 57
on the easterly Right of Way line of Keith Drive; thence

1.

2.
3.

»

SOeNOO,

Over and thru Lot 56, North 19 degrees 02 minutes 11 seconds East 63.55
feet, and

North 06 degrees 54 minutes 39 seconds West 85.02 feet; thence

Along a line common to Lot 55 and Lot 56, South 70 degrees 57 minutes 49
seconds East 13.53 feet; thence

Over and thru Lot 56, South 23 degrees 19 minutes 48 seconds East 37.13
feet,

South 09 degrees 48 minutes 16 seconds East 28.48 feet,

South 14 degrees 06 minutes 26 seconds East 27.14 feet

South 19 degrees 10 minutes 08 seconds East 24.34 feet,

South 70 degrees 57 minutes 49 seconds East 30.90 feet and

South 19 degrees 02 minutes 11 seconds West 45.76 feet; thence

Along a line common to Lot 56 and Lot 57, North 70 degrees 57 minutes 49
seconds West 75.88 feet to the point and place of beginning

Containing 6021 square feet, more or less.

Subject to a Conservation Easement as shown on said Filed Map.

Subject to and together with all legal easements, Right of Ways and restrictions of
record, if any.

ESE Consultants, Inc.
60 Merritt Bivd,, Suite 100 « Fishkill, NY 12524

p: 845.897.8900 - f: 845.897.8901



SCHEDULE "A"
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SURVEY OF PROPERTY
LOT 56

Land Planning

Engineering

FRANK FARM SUBDIVISION

TOWN OF LAGRANGE, DUTCHESS COUNTY, NY

Land Surveying
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Clark Patterson Lee

DESIGN PROFESSIONALS

September 9, 2013

Mr. Joseph Luna, Supervisor
and Town of LaGrange Board
120 Stringham Road
LaGrangeville, New York 12540

Re: Town of LaGrange
Grandview Water District
Booster Pump Station Upgrade Project
Job # 11278.92

Dear Supervisor Luna and Members of the Town Board:

The Town of LaGrange received three (3) bid for the Grandview Water District Booster
Pump Station Upgrade Project. The bids in the amount of $47,760, $83,100, and $95,000
were received from Environmental Consultants, Grant Street Construction and Standard
Construction, respectively.

Non-Collusive Bidding Certificate, Bid Bond, acknowledgement of receipt of addendums
were provided by Environmental Consultants, LLC.

Based on Clark Patterson Lee’s (CPL) evaluation of the bids received, CPL recommends
that the Town Board award the contract to Environmental Consultants, LLC in the
amount of $47,760.

If you have any questions, please contact me at 845-567-2011 ext. 2119.
Sincerely,

CLARK PATTERSON LEE

(nea Polnen

Greg W. Bolner, P.E. /{M
Principal Associate

cc: Christine O'Reilly Rao, Town Clerk -
Christine Toussaint, Town Comptroller
Wanda Livigni, Administrator of Public Works

Ronald C. Blass, Jr., Van DeWater and Van DeWater, Town Attorney

900 Corporate Boulevard
Newburgh, NY 12550
clarkpatterson.com
800.274.9000 TEL
845.567.9614 rax



BID RESULTS - 2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

BITUMINOUS MIX COLD / HOT
ACCEPTED BID RESULTS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

*%%%% BOLD FACE NUMBERS ARE RECOMMENDED BIDS FOR APPROVAL
PRICE PER TON

HOT COLD

1.  Dutchess Quarry & Supply Co. $ 66.50* $ 85.00%
410 North Avenue
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
845-635-2174

2. Tilcon New York Inc. $ 68.00* $ NO BID
461 Sheafe Road
New Hamburg, NY 12590
845-358-4500

3. Thalle Industries $ 70.00* $ NO BID
172 Route 9
Fishkill, NY 12524
845-896-5156 X 106

4. Package Pavement $ NO-BID  $78.00
P.O. Box 408
Stormville, NY 12582
845-221-2224

*Based on September 2013 NYS Asphalt index of $597.00/ton, this price is subject to escalation /
de-escalation.

My recommendation is that we award blacktop to both Dutchess Quarry and Tilcon due to the
location of each plant. It is more cost effective to haul from Tilcon when we are on the South side of
town and Dutchess Quarry when we are on the North side of town.



l.

BID RESULTS - 2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

BITUMINOUS ROAD MATERIALS
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER
MATERIALS PER GAL
Peckham Materials Corp. Road Tars (all grades) $ NO BID
P.O. Box 3779 Latex Emulsion $2.667
Kingston, NY 12402 Latex Primer & Sealer $2.467
845-331-4148 Latex MP Material $2.72

Base Conditioner $ NO BID



1.

Expanded Supply Products, Inc.
3330 Route 9

Cold Spring, NY 10516
845-265-3771

BID RESULTS - 2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

CAST IRON FRAMES AND GRATES
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER
DEILVERED DELIVERED
CAST IRON CAST IRON
3433 BP & GRATE 24” X 24>
$ 439.00 $178.90

DELIVERED
CAST IRON
30” X 30”

$ 237.50
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BID RESULTS - 2013-2014
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

1. Expanded Supply
3330 Route 9
Cold Spring, NY, 10516
845-265-3771

2. Northside Supply
501 Salt Point Tpk.
Poughkeepsie, NY 12603
845-454-3730

CATCH BASINS
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

24"x24"x24” 1D Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
247x24”x6" Concrete Riser
24"x24x9" Concrete Riser
24"x24"x12" Concrete Riser

247x24"x24" Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

427x60" x36™ OD Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
427x60” x6” Concrete Riser
427x60” x9" Concrete Riser
427x60" x12” Concrete Riser

427x60™ x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

307x30"x30” OD Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
30"x30"x6” Concrete Riser
30"x30"x9” Concrete Riser
307x307x12” Concrete Riser

307x30"x24" Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

247x24"x24” ID Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
247x247x6™ Concrete Riser
247x247x9” Concrete Riser
247x24"x12” Concrete Riser

247x24”x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

427x60™ x36” OD Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
427x60" x6” Concrete Riser
427x60" x9" Concrete Riser
427x60” x12” Concrete Riser

427x60" x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

30"x30"x30” OD Knockout Basin Delivered to Yard
30"x30"x6™ Concrete Riser
30"x307x9"  Concrete Riser
307x30"x 12 Concrete Riser

30"x30"x24” Concrete Riser
ALL RISERS DELIVERED TO YARD

Per Basin $ 199.00
Per Basin $ 90.00
Per Basin $ 110.00
PerBasin $  79.00
Per Basin $ 140.00

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin

$ 339.00
$ 150.00
$ 165.00
$ 128.00
$214.00

$ 259.00
$119.00
$119.00
$119.00
$ 199.00

Per Basin $ 160.00
Per Basin $ NO BID
Per Basin $ NO BID
PerBasin $ 78.00
Per Basin $ 105.00

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin

Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin
Per Basin

Per Basin

$210.00
$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$ 100.00
$ 120.00

$ 209.00
$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$ 75.00
$ NO BID



BID RESULTS - 2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

DRYWELLS
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

1. Expanded Supply Products, Inc.

3330 Route 9
Cold Spring, NY 10516 PRICE PER
845-265-3771 DRYWELL

630 + - Drywell H20 delivered to yard — H20 $ 620.00

1000 + - Drywell H20 delivered to yard — H20 $ 1,290.00

2. Northside Supply
501 Salt Point Tpk.
Poughkeepsie, NY 12603
845-454-3730

630 + - Drywell H20 delivered to yard — H20 $ 780.00

1000 + - Drywell H20 delivered to yard — H20 $ 980.00



1.

Chemung Supply Corp.
P.O. Box 527

Elmira, NY 14902
607-733-5500

BID RESULTS - 2013-2014
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

GUIDE RAILS
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER

NEW “W” Beam Rail Galvanized
NEW 3” Post Galvanized
NEW 6” Post Galvanized

USED “W” Beam Rail Galvanized
USED 3” Post Galvanized
USED 6” Post Galvanized

Post Nuts & Bolts

End Piece for “W” Beam Rail Galvanized
Installation of Guiderail Complete
Installation of Guiderail Equipment

$ 7.24
$ 54.20
$ 54.20

$ 4.18
$ 28.20
$ 28.20

$ 1.12
$ 64.18
$ 8.74
$294.00

per ft.
each
each

per ft.
each
each

each
each
per ft.
per hr.
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BID RESULTS - 2013-2014
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

GALVANIZED CMP
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

SIZE MIN. GAUGE PRICE PER FT
1. Chemung Supply Corp. 427x29’° 16 $ 27.24
P.O. Box 527 497x33’ 16 $ 31.54
Elmira, NY 14902 577x38’ 16 $ 37.74
607-733-5506 047x43’ 14 $ 50.84
717x47 12 $ 71.44
777x52° 12 $ 97.60
817x59’ 12 $109.84
877x63’ 12 $118.14
PRICE PER BAND (Minimum width 12”)
SIZE MIN. GAUGE PRICE PER FT
427x29’° 16 $ 27.24
497x33’ 16 $ 31.54
577x38’ 16 $ 37.74
647x43’ 14 $ 76.26
717°x47 12 $101.68
777x52° 12 $142.88
817x59° 12 $219.68
877x63’ 12 $236.28
SIZE MIN. GAUGE PRICE PER FT
2. Expanded Supply Prod., Inc. 427x29’° 16 $ 27.90
3330 Route 9 497x33’ 16 $ 32.53
Cold Spring, NY 10516 57"x38’ 16 $ 38.91
845-265-3771 647x43’ 14 $ 5243
717x47 12 $ 72.56
77°x52° 12 $ 98.14
817x59’ 12 $113.26
877x63° 12 $121.82
PRICE PER BAND (Minimum width 12”)
SIZE MIN. GAUGE  PRICE PER FT
427x29’ 16 $ 27.90
49”x33’ 16 $ 48.80
577x38’ 16 $ 58.37
647x43’ 14 $ 78.65
717°x47° 12 $108.84
777°x52° 12 $196.28
817°x59° 12 $226.52

877x63’ 12 $243.64
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BID RESULTS - 2013-2014
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER

PER GALLON

1. Peckham Materials Corp. $ 1.08

Union Street
Athens, NY 12015
800-942-8947
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1.

Jeff Daley & Sons Oil Service, Inc.

131 Pine Hill Road
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
845-635-8522

Wilson Oil

634 Route 52
Beacon, NY 12508
845-831-4138

BID RESULTS - 2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

DIESEL MOTOR FUEL
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

PER GALLON

$ .1385 Over rack price at time of delivery.
This includes winter blend.

$ .30 Over rack price.



BID RESULTS -2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

UNLEADED GASOLINE
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER
PER GALLON
1. Jeff Daley & Sons Oil Service, Inc. $ .1399 Over rack price at time of
131 Pine Hill Road delivery.

Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
845-635-8522



BID RESULTS - 2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

FUEL OIL
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

PER GALLON
1. Jeff Daley & Sons Oil Service, Inc. $ .09  Over rack price @ time of delivery.
131 Pine Hill Road
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
845-635-8522
2. Wilson Oil $ .30 Over rack price.

634 Route 52
Beacon, NY 12508
845-831-4138



BID RESULTS -2013-2014
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

WASHED HIGHWAY GRADE SAND
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ITEM PER TON PLANT LOCATION
. Red Wing Properties Delivered to Hwy Garage $ 19.00 Billings, NY
P.O. Box 408
Stormville, NY 12582 F.O.B Seller’s Storage $ 16.00 Billings, NY
845-221-2224
. Route 82 Sand & Gravel Delivered to Hwy Garage  $ 20.00 Millbrook, NY
17 Canoe Hill Road
Millbrook, NY 12545 F.O.B Seller’s Storage $15.00 Millbrook, NY
845-471-8700
. Thalle, Industries Delivered to Hwy Garage $ 20.00 Fishkill, NY
172 Route 9
Fishkill, NY 12524 F.O.B Seller’s Storage $ 13.00 Fishkill, NY
845-896-5156 X 106
. Dutchess Quarry & Supply Delivered to Hwy Garage $ 18.50 Fishkill, NY
410 North Avenue
Pleasant Valley, NY 12569 F.O.B Seller’s Storage $ 14.00 Fishkill, NY

845-635-2174

My recommendation is that we award the washed highway grade sand to Redwing as they meet the bid
specification the best. Redwing will deliver @ $19.00 per ton and FOB @ $16.00 per ton. Thalle Ind.
and Dutchess Quarry did not bring samples of their sand for testing therefore not meeting the bid
specifications. Rt. #82 Sand has to many fine particles in the material so they don’t meet the bid
specifications.



BID RESULTS -2013-2014
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

SCREENED TOPSOIL
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ITEM PER TON PLANT LOCATION

1. Red Wing Properties Delivered to Hwy Garage $ 28.00 Billings, NY

P.O. Box 408

Stormville, NY 12582 F.O.B Seller’s Storage $ 25.00 Billings, NY

845-221-2224
2. Richard Ryan Excavating  Delivered to Hwy Garage $ 28.00 LaGrangeville, NY

5 Ryandale Drive

LaGrangeville, NY 12540 F.O.B Seller’s Storage $ 23.00 LaGrangeville, NY

845-223-5761

My recommendation is both Red Wing and Richard Ryan both be awarded delivered screened topsoil @
$28.00 per ton and Richard Ryan FOB @ $23.00 per ton.



. East Coast Industrial S

P.O. Box 1069
Pine Bush, NY 12566
845-744-8148

. Community Custom

24 South Cross Road
Staatsburg, NY 12580
845-889-4142

BID RESULTS -2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

ROAD SWEEPING SERVICES
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

PRICE PER MILE

ervices, Inc. $ 343.39

$ 380.00



1.

RCT, Inc.
27 Commerce Street

BID RESULTS - 2013-2014
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

SUB-BASE COURSE MATERIAL 1,2 &4
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ONLY BIDDER
MATERIAL DELIVERED F.O.B. PLANT
(per ton) (per ton)
Sub-Base Coarse, Type 1 $16.00 $12.00
Sub-Base Coarse, Type2  $16.00 $12.00
$12.00

Poughkeepsie, NY 12603 Sub-Base Coarse, Type 4  $16.00

845-471-8700



BID RESULTS - 2013-2014

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

R.O.B. GRAVEL
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

ITEM PER TON PLANT LOCATION

Red Wing Properties R.O.B Gravel - Delivered $ 12.75 Milan, NY
P.O. Box 408 R.O.B Gravel - F.O.B $ 17.00 Billings, NY
Stormville, NY 12582
845-221-2224

. Richard Ryan Excavating ~ R.O.B Gravel - Delivered $ 15.00 LaGrangeville, NY
5 Ryandale Drive R.O.B Gravel - F.0.B $ 9.00 LaGrangeville, NY
LaGrangeville, NY 12540
845-223-5761

. Route 82 Sand & Gravel R.O.B Gravel — Delivered $ 24.50 Millbrook, NY
27 Commerce Street R.O.B Gravel - F.O.B $ 17.00 Millbrook, NY

Poughkeepsie, NY 12603
845-266-3433



1.

Dutchess Quarry

P.O. Box 651

Pleasant Valley, NY 12569
845-635-2174

. Thalle Industries

172 Route 9

Fishkill, NY 12524
845-896-5156 X 106

. Richard Ryan Excavating

5 Ryandale Drive

LaGrangeville, NY 12540
845-223-5761

Tilcon New York, Inc.

461 Sheafe Road

New Hamburg, NY 12590
845-358-4500

BID RESULTS - 2013-2014
HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

CRUSHED QUARRY STONE
ACCEPTED BIDS ARE HIGHLIGHTED

Tailings

Light Stone Fill
1

3/8”

1"

o

1”& 27

Item 4

Tailings

Light Stone Fill
%9’

3/8”

12"

o

1”& 27

[tem 4

Tailings

Light Stone Fill
%”

3/8”

1"

o

1”& 27

Item 4

Tailings

Light Stone Fill
L

3/8”

17"

o

1”& 27

[tem 4

DELIVERED

(per ton)

§ NOBID
$19.75

$ 18.75
$18.75
$ 18.25
$ NO BID
$ 18.75
$16.75

$22.00
$27.00
$24.00
$23.00
$23.00
$23.00
$23.00
$22.00

$20.00
$ NO BID
§ NO BID
$ NO BID
$22.00
$ NO BID
$22.00
$22.00

$ NO BID
$24.80
$22.80
$22.80
$21.80
$22.80
$21.80
$20.30

F.O.B. PLA NT

(per ton)

$ NOBID
$15.25
$14.25
$14.25
$13.75
$§ NO BID
$14.25
$12.25

$15.00
$20.00

$17.00
$ 16.00
$16.00
$16.00
$16.00
$ 15.00

$ 15.00
$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$ NO BID
$17.00
$ NO BID
$17.00
$17.00

$ NO BID
$19.00
$17.00
$17.00
$ 16.00
$17.00
$ 16.00
$ 14.50




